TABULATION OF BIDS

PROJECT: Pavement Repairs, Various Locations

Island of Hawaii

PROJECT NO.: HWY-HM-2016-03, Area 2, (West Side)

STATE OF HAWAII

ISLAND: Hawaii GRACE PACIFIC JAS W. GLOVER, LTD. YAMADA & SONS, INC. DEPARTMENT OF
CORPORATION TRANSPORTATION
DATE ADVERTISED: Honolulu Star-Bulletin, Hawaii Tribune Herald - July 27, 2015 HIGHWAYS DIVISION
BID OPENED: August 27, 2015
(No Bid)
COMPLETION TIME: 12 Months with option to extend to two addiotional twelve month periods.
APPROX.
ITEM NO. ITEM QUANTITY | UNIT USED | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
401.0100 | HMA Mix IV Leveling (Less than 150 tons) 1 TON $90.00 $90.00 $262.50 $262.50
401.0110 | HMA Mix V Leveling (Greater than 150 tons) 1 TON $90.00 $90.00 $205.00 $205.00
401.0410 | 1-1/2 Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (Less than 1760 SY) 1 SY $30.00 $30.00 $39.44 $39.44
401.0411 | 1- 1/2 Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (1,761 to 5,280 SY) 1 SY $25.00 $25.00 $35.95 $35.95
401.0412 | 1- 1/2 Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (5,281 to 12,320 SY) 1 SY $24.00 $24.00 $34.92 $34.92
401.0413 | 1- 1/2 Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (Over 12,320 SY) 1 SY $23.00 $23.00 $32.18 $32.18
401.0420 | 2- Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (Less than 1,760 SY) 1 sy $43.00 $43.00 $48.93 $48.93
401.0421 | 2- Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (1,761 to 5,280 SY) 1 sy $39.00 $39.00 $44.32 $44.32
401.0422 | 2- Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (5,281 to 12,320 SY) 1 SY $37.00 $37.00 $42.48 $42.48
401.0423 | 2- Inch HMA Pavement, Mix [V (Over 12,320 SY) 1 sy $35.00 $35.00 $39.99 $39.99
401.0510 3- Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (Less than 1,760 SY) 1 SY $63.00 $63.00 $61.59 $61.59
401.0520 | 3- Inch HMA Pavement, Mix [V (1,761 to 5,280 SY) 1 sy $61.00 $61.00 $54.47 $54.47
401.0530 | 3- Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (5,281 to 12,320 SY) 1 sY $57.00 $57.00 $53.23 $53.23
401.0540 | 3- Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (Over 12,320 SY) 1 sy $55.00 $55.00 $52.22 $55.22
401.0610 4- Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (Less than 1,760 SY) 1 SY $82.00 $82.00 $78.58 $78.58
401.0620 | 4- Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (1,761 to 5,280 SY) 1 SY $79.00 $79.00 $71.69 $71.69
401.0630 | 4- Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (5,281 to 12,320 SY) 1 SY $75.00 $75.00 $69.48 $69.48
401.0640 | 4- Inch HMA Pavement, Mix IV (Over 12,320 SY) 1 SY $70.00 $70.00 $66.79 $66.79
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TABULATION OF BIDS

PROJECT: Pavement Repairs, Various Locations

Island of Hawaii

PROJECT NO.: HWY-HM-2016-03, Area?, (WestSide)

STATE OF HAWAII

ISLAND: Hawaii GRACE PACIFIC JAS W. GLOVER, LTD. YAMADA & SONS, INC. DEPARTMENT OF
CORPORATION TRANSPORTATION
DATE ADVERTISED: Honolulu Star-Bulletin, Hawaii Tribune Herald - July 27, 2015 HIGHWAYS DIVISION
BID OPENED: August 27, 2015
(No Bid)
COMPLETION TIME: 12 Months with option to extend to two addiotional twelve month periods.
APPROX.

ITEM NO. ITEM QUANTITY | UNIT USED | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
414.0110 Reconstruction of Weakened Pavement Areas (Less than 1 SY $165.00 $165.00 $191.47 $191.47

250 SY)
414.0120 Reconstruction of Weakened Pavement Area (251 to 500 1 SY $117.00 $117.00 $144.38 $144.38

SY)
414.0130 Reconstruction of Weakened Pavement Areas (501 to 750 1 SY $108.00 $108.00 $128.05 $125.05

SY)
414.0140 | Reconstruction of Weakened Pavement Areas (Over 750 1 SY $91.00 $91.00 $119.82 $119.82

SY)
416.0150 | Scarify Existing Pavement 1 SY $12.00 $12.00 $15.50 $15.50
417.1000 | Cut Cores in Existing Pavement 1 EACH $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00
629.0100 | 4" Pavement Striping, Less Than 500 LF (Thermoplastic 1 LF $1.05 $1.05 $11.00 $11.00

Extrusion)
629.0110 | 4" Pavement Striping, Greater Than 500 LF 1 LF $1.05 $1.05 $11.00 $11.00

(Thermoplastic Extrusion)
629.0120 8" Pavement Striping, Less Than 500 LF (Thermoplastic 1 LF $1.60 $1.60 $11.00 $11.00

Extrusion)
629.0130 | 8" Pavement Striping, Greater Than 500 LF (Thermoplastic 1 LF $1.60 $1.60 $11.00 $11.00

Extrusion)
629.0140 | 12" Pavement Striping, Less Than 200 LF (Thermoplastic 1 LF $2.10 $2.10 $12.00 $12.00

Extrusion)
629.0150 12" Pavement Striping, Greater Than 200 LF (Thermoplastic 1 LF $2.10 $2.10 $12.00 $12.00

Extrusion)
629.0200 | Crosswalk Marking (Thermoplastic Extrusion) 1 LANE $2.00 $2.00 $110.00 $110.00
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TABULATION OF BIDS

PROJECT: Pavement Repairs, Various Locations
Island of Hawaii
PROJECT NO.: HWY-HM-2016-03, AreaZ, (West Side)
STATE OF HAWAII
ISLAND: Hawaii GRACE PACIFIC JAS W. GLOVER, LTD. YAMADA & SONS, INC. DEPARTMENT OF
CORPORATION TRANSPORTATION
DATE ADVERTISED: Honolulu Star-Bulletin, Hawaii Tribune Herald - July 27, 2015 HIGHWAYS DIVISION
BID OPENED: August 27, 2015
(No Bid)
COMPLETION TIME: 12 Months with option to extend to two addiotional twelve month periods.
APPROX.

ITEM NO. ITEM QUANTITY | UNITUSED | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
629.0300 Pavement Word (Thermoplastic Extrusion) 1 EACH $2.00 $2.00 $60.00 $60.00
629.0400 Pavement Arrow (Thermoplastic Extrusion) 1 EACH $2.00 $2.00 $50.00 $50.00
629.0500 | Type A Pavement Marker 1 EACH $1.60 $1.60 $11.50 $11.50
629.0600 | Type J Pavement Marker 1 EACH $1.60 $1.60 $11.50 $11.50
629.0700 | Type C Pavement Marker 1 EACH $2.40 $2.40 $12.25 $12.25
629.0800 | Type D Pavement Marker 1 EACH $2.40 $2.40 $12.25 $12.25
629.0900 | Type H Pavement Marker 1 EACH $2.40 $2.40 $12.25 $12.25
645.1000 | Electronic Message Board 1 DAY $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

Sum of All Items $1,507.90 $2,251.73 No Bid

A. Hawaii Products $67.20 $122.34

Amount for Comparison of Bids $1,440.70 $2,129.39 No Bid

Project Manager:
Date:

Sal Panem
September 11, 2015
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